Subject: Invoice for the Geert Wilders Event

From: Alicia Q. Ferguson <aliciaf@temple.edu>
Date: Thu, Dec 3, 2009 at 1:53 PM
To: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED)]

c,%'('/k/ Q f‘;%f( U671

Reservation Coordinator

Student Center Operations

1755 N. 13th Street

Suite 219M

Philadelphia, PA 19122

aliciaf@temple.edu

215-204-7131, fax 215-204-1846
http://hgsc-main.temple.edu/virtualems/
http://www.temple.edu/studentaffairs/studentcenters/hgsc/vendor.html
http://tucapture.mediasite.com/tucapture/Catalog/Front.aspx?cid=79c77e30-fc3c-4364-9a0f-
2fc347971el10

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Date: Thu, Dec 3, 2009 at 2:00 PM

To: "Alicia Q. Ferguson" <aliciaf@temple.edu>, Alvaro Enrigue WATSON [CONTACT
INFORMATION REDACTED], MEGAN ANN CANTY [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED],
[CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED)]

Ms Ferguson,

Hello. I was hoping you could elaborate upon the previous email with an attached invoice. | am
not quite sure what this is for as | paid the security fees for the Wilder's Event last month and was
not informed of any additional charges that would be applied to TUP's account at that time. | also
had not received anything from you stating that there would be additional fees for the event, so if
you could clarify for me what the invoice is in reference to, and what, if any, action is required to
be taken by me it would be greatly appreciated.

Brittany Walsh

Interim President
Vice President of Operations
Temple University Purpose

"Socially Driven, Politically Aware"

[CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

From: Alicia Q. Ferguson <aliciaf@temple.edu>

Date: Thu, Dec 3, 2009 at 3:08 PM

To: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED)]

Who did you pay and how much?



From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2009 3:01 PM

To: Alicia Q. Ferguson; Alvaro Enriqgue WATSON; MEGAN ANN CANTY; [CONTACT
INFORMATION REDACTED]

Subject: Re: Invoice for the Geert Wilders Event

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]
Date: Thu, Dec 10, 2009 at 9:30 PM
To: "Alicia Q. Ferguson" <aliciaf@temple.edu>

Ms Ferguson,
TUP paid $576.00 on October 27th to a Ms. Lee. Our reciept number is 380525.

From: ALICIA Q. FERGUSON <aliciaf@temple.edu>
Date: Fri, Dec 11, 2009 at 8:33 AM
To: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

So you will just need to pay the balance. Who told you how much the bill was?

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2009 10:30 PM
To: Alicia Q. Ferguson

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Date: Fri, Dec 11, 2009 at 9:46 AM

To: "ALICIA Q. FERGUSON" <aliciaf@temple.edu>, Alvaro Enrigue WATSON [CONTACT
INFORMATION REDACTED], [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Ms. Ferguson,

TUP paid the amount provided in the contract by you, which was taken by Ms. Lee. Additionally,
in my meeting with Jason, Maureen, and Gina on the 16th of October, Jason stated to me, that
the university would have to eat the extra cost to hold the event; which the university did not have
a problem doing according to him. Also, through all of the time spent organizing the event with
Jason it was never mentioned that what he had explained to me on that Friday had changed.
Moreover, had there been an amendment to our contract | should have been contacted prior to
the 3rd of December, especially given that the event was 7 weeks before. If you could be so kind,
would you please send me a copy of policy regarding this situation, as well as the contract which
was given to Ms. Lee on the 27th.

Best Regards,

From: ALICIA Q. FERGUSON <aliciaf@temple.edu>

Date: Fri, Dec 11, 2009 at 9:51 AM

To: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED], Alvaro Enrigue WATSON
[CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED], [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]




I will speak with Jason regarding the university eating the cost.

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2009 10:47 AM
To: ALICIA Q. FERGUSON; Alvaro Enriqgue WATSON; [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Ms. Ferguson,

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]

Date: Fri, Dec 11, 2009 at 12:20 PM

To: "ALICIA Q. FERGUSON?" <aliciaf@temple.edu>

Cc: Alvaro Enrique WATSON [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED], [CONTACT
INFORMATION REDACTED]

Thank you.

From: BRITTANY P WALSH [CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]
Date: Tue, Dec 22, 2009 at 4:54 PM
To: "ALICIA Q. FERGUSON" <aliciaf@temple.edu>

Ms. Ferguson,

We last corresponded on the 11th of December concerning the Wilders event, and so, | was
hoping you could update me on your conversation with Mr. Levy.
Thank you

Brittany Walsh

Vice President of Operations
Temple University Purpose

"Socially Driven, Politically Aware"

[CONTACT INFORMATION REDACTED]



